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In the year 2045, the real world is a harsh place. The only time Wade Watts (Tye Sheridan) truly feels
alive is when he escapes to the OASIS, an immersive virtual universe where most of humanity
spends their days. In the OASIS, you can go anywhere, do anything, be anyone-the only limits are
your own imagination. The OASIS was created by the brilliant and eccentric James Halliday (Mark
Rylance), who left his immense fortune and total control of the Oasis to the winner of a three-part
contest he designed to find a worthy heir. When Wade conquers the first challenge of the reality-
bending treasure hunt, he and his friends-aka the High Five-are hurled into a fantastical universe of
discovery and danger to save the OASIS. In the year 2045, people can escape their harsh reality in
the OASIS, an immersive virtual world where you can go anywhere, do anything, be anyone--the only
limits are your own imagination. OASIS creator James Halliday left his immense fortune and control
of the Oasis to the winner of a contest designed to find a worthy heir. When unlikely hero Wade
Watts conquers the first challenge of the reality-bending treasure hunt, he and his friends--known as
the High Five--are hurled into a fantastical universe of discovery and danger to save the OASIS and
their world. What is fun about this movie?... the visuals and all the pop culture references.. you might
will have the eager to re-watch just to catch what you missed the first time. The plot is not unique
and few scenes were rushed, but the presentation is amazing. I didn't read the book but heard that it
is different from this movie and I hope it gave more background story to the main characters as what
was given in this movie was a shell for most characters. The main message that can be obtained
from this movie is easily understood.

It is definitely worth the time for watching at least one time (maybe re-watching just to catch what
you missed the first time you watched!). I had very little expectations for this movie, especially since
the ones I know who watched it said that it wasn't all that spectacular. Well, I got the chance to sit
down and watch "Ready Player One", had the time to spare, so why not?

I must say that I was surprised with the result of this movie, because it was actually rather
entertaining. Sure, it had a predictable and generic storyline, but it was still entertaining enough for
what it was.

What really blew me away was the special effects and CGI. This was definitely spectacular, and there
were so many details. I love the overwhelming amount of familiar characters that there were to be
seen throughout the entire movie. There were so many pop culture characters and obscure
characters that only true nerds of movies, gaming, comics, etc. would recognize. It was especially
awesome to see Jason Voorhees and Spawn make appearances as avatars in the movie as well.

There was a good flow to the movie and it kept its upbeat pace all the way to the very end, and that
made for some entertaining stuff.

I will say that the movie is worth watching again, not for the story or the special effects, but for
picking out familiar characters used as Oasis avatars in the movie, that would be quite a task.

All in all, "Ready Player One" is definitely worth taking the time to sit down and watch. And it had a
lovely morale as well, and that being that people need to live their lives in the real life and not in an
online illusion of a world. The sheer dynamism and energy of the movie are compelling, even when
the character drama isn’t. a5c7b9f00b 
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